
C:\Users\Eman\Downloads\transportation from the airport to xylokastro.doc 

1 

Transportation from the airport to Xylokastro.  

There are 3 ways to travel.  

 By the suburban train (“proastiakos”) – we arrange pick up from Kiato 
train station for about 30€  

 The train station is located within the area of the airport. Its easy to 
follow signs from the arrival gate to the suburban train station.  

 You ask a ticket (at about €15) to Kiato, which is the last stop before 
Xylokastro (i.e. Le CONVIVIAL). You may have to change train, but 
this is depending to the particular train schedule. At any rate, this is 
very simple, even, to change train.  

 On obtaining the ticket to the train, please, call us one more time (for 
the exact arrival at Kiato) at +30 27430 29103 to arrange for a pick-
up taxi from Kiato (last stop of the suburban train) to Xylokastro (i.e. 
Le CONVIVIAL). The distance between Kiato-Xylokastro is about 10 
Kilometers traveling through the beautiful seafront road.  

 The cost of the taxi is about €30, each way and this sum will be 
charged on you from the hotel, upon your arrival. 

 By renting a car 

 At the airport and keep this car during your stay, so that be 
independent to travel all the time. All major rent-a-car companies 
have an office at the airport. Driving from the airport to the hotel is 
very easy because, you probably may drive straight on one highway.  

 The signs are: ELEFSINA-KORINTHOS-KIATO-exit to 
XYLOKASTRO. Distance kilometers 121 – time about 1hr 30’-40’. 
There are 3 toll stations cost of all is about € 10. The legal speed of 
your car must be 100 to 120 Kilometers per hour (or less, depending 
on traffic conditions).  

  Pick up service from the Airport - We arrange a hired taxi for 
approximately 150 €  

 To send you (smoothly like car service) that shall pick you up from 
the airport and bring you at the door of the hotel. Cost is about €150 
(depending on date and time).  

 The less expensive transportation is by traveling with the suburban 
train and taxi (Kiato-Xylokastro). The train is clean, speedy and 
effective. It takes about 1h and 45’ to arrive.  

 At all times, please, send us your time of arrival and the flight you are 
coming to the Athens airport, so that we are aware of your 
movements and also, let us know, the method of using to reach the 
hotel from the airport, also your cell phone, please.  

 You can find schedule of the suburban train at: www.proastiakos.net  

 

http://www.proastiakos.net/

